

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 26, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE	TOTAL			
GROUP 1 - American Darling Fire Hydrant Parts					BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
1.	15 set Bolt & nut set, barrel, material plated steel, used for 5 1/4", 8 each/set, Model B62B, Part 54-62-39-7	UNIT					
		PRICE	38.60				
		TOTAL		579.00			
2.	10 ea. Bolt & nut set, base, material rustproof steel, used for 5 1/4" Model B62B, Part 54-62-39	UNIT					
		PRICE	22.60				
		TOTAL		226.00			
3.	15 ea. Coupling, breakable rod, material gray iron, used for 5 1/4" Brand B62B, Part #54-62-29-30	UNIT					
		PRICE	33.60				
		TOTAL		504.00			
4.	20 set Coupling, cotter pins, size 8" x 15", Range A 8.50-9.37, material stainless steel used for 5 1/4" & 6", 2 each set Brand B62B, Part #54-62-29-31	UNIT					
		PRICE	13.21				
		TOTAL		264.20			
5.	2 ea. Coupling, rod, material cast iron, used for 5" brand B50B	UNIT					
		PRICE	35.92				
		TOTAL		71.84			
6.	5 ea. Cover, housing, used for gray iron, brand B-62-B, part #62-9	UNIT					
		PRICE	40.75				
		TOTAL		203.75			
7.	15 ea. Flange, breakable, material cast iron, used for 5-1/4", brand B-84-B, Part# 84-29-15	UNIT					
		PRICE	31.18				
		TOTAL		467.70			
8.	2 ea. Flange, breakable, material gray iron, used for 5-1/4", brand B-62-B Part #62-29-15	UNIT					
		PRICE	53.44				
		TOTAL		106.88			
9.	10 ea. Gasket, barrel, material composition rubber, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #60-84-38-1	UNIT					
		PRICE	4.84				
		TOTAL		48.40			
10.	15 ea. Gasket, barrel, material composition rubber, used for 5-1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-38-1	UNIT					
		PRICE	4.84				
		TOTAL		72.60			
11.	2 ea. Gasket, barrel, material rubber, used for 5", Model B50B, Part #50-29-20	UNIT					
		PRICE	13.12				
		TOTAL		26.24			
12.	5 ea. Gasket, cover, material fiber, used for 5-1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #54-84-13	UNIT					
		PRICE	4.84				
		TOTAL		24.20			
13.	10 set Gasket, drain ring, material composition rubber, used for 5-1/4", 2 each/set Model B-84-B, Part #84-38	UNIT					
		PRICE	9.67				
		TOTAL		96.70			
14.	2 ea. Gasket, drain ring, used for 5", model B-50-B	UNIT					
		PRICE	5.53				
		TOTAL		11.06			
15.	5 ea. Gasket, housing, material composition rubber, used for 5-1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-14	UNIT					
		PRICE	4.84				
		TOTAL		24.20			
16.	2 ea. Gasket, seat, used for 5", Model B-50-B	UNIT					
		PRICE	20.03				
		TOTAL		40.06			
17.	5 ea. Gasket, steamer, material rubber, used for 5-1/4", Model B-84-B, Part#6-84-27	UNIT					
		PRICE	4.84				
		TOTAL		24.20			

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Morrison Supply Co.
 5340 N Loop 1604 E
 San Antonio, TX 78247

Municipal Water Works Supply
 6959 State Hwy 276
 Royse City, TX 75189

Hydraflo, Inc.
 1030 Milam St.
 Beaumont, TX 77701

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 26, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Morrison Supply Co.
 5340 N Loop 1604 E
 San Antonio, TX 78247

Municipal Water Works Supply
 6959 State Hwy 276
 Royse City, TX 75189

Hydraflo, Inc.
 1030 Milam St.
 Beaumont, TX 77701

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE	TOTAL			
18.	20 ea. Kit, breakaway 1985 and old, used for 5-1/4" includes 8 bolts, Model B62B	UNIT	110.70	2,214.00	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
19.	3 ea. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model B62B	UNIT	192.70	578.10			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
20.	15 ea. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model B84B-250	UNIT	167.04	2,505.60			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
21.	10 ea. Kit, extension, size 6", used for 5 1/4", Model B84B-250	UNIT	162.61	1,626.10			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
22.	50 ea. Kit, fire hydrant, traffic, used for 5 1/4", includes 8 bolts, Model B84B-250	UNIT	169.13	8,456.50			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
23.	15 ea. Kit, traffic repair quick fix, used for 5 1/4", includes flange, Model B62B, Part #B55204-KIT	UNIT	190.38	2,855.70			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
24.	5 ea. Lever, drain, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #84-31	UNIT	98.74	493.70			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
25.	5 ea. Lever, drain, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #12059	UNIT	108.61	543.05			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
26.	10 ea. Nut, operating, material bronze B763, Alloy 844, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #54-84-1	UNIT	129.77	1,297.70			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
27.	2 ea. Nut, segment bolt, used for 5", Model B-50-B	UNIT	19.75	39.50			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
28.	5 ea. Nut, travel stop, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #84-30-06	UNIT	19.04	95.20			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
29.	20 ea. Overhaul kit, fire hydrant, used for fire hydrant repair, Model B-84-B, MFG Part #03KIT 1 051	UNIT	68.00	1,360.00			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
30.	20 ea. Overhaul kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-62-B N.S., Mfg Part #03KIT 1 050	UNIT	72.00	1,440.00			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
31.	25 ea. Overhaul kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-62-B O.S., Mfg. Part #03KIT 1 050	UNIT	68.00	1,700.00			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
32.	15 ea. Overhaul kit, free hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Mfg. Part #03KIT 1 051	UNIT	68.00	1,020.00			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
33.	5 ea. Pin, coupling, kit used for 5", Model B-50-B, A-159621-5 H525 62/H600 84 F/1-1/4 SQ	UNIT	14.43	72.15			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
34.	5 ea. Pin, rod coupling, used for 5", Model B-50-B	UNIT	7.22	36.10			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					
35.	1 ea. O-Ring cover, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-2-1	UNIT		2.82			
		PRICE					
		TOTAL					

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 26, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Morrison Supply Co.
 5340 N Loop 1604 E
 San Antonio, TX 78247

Municipal Water Works Supply
 6959 State Hwy 276
 Royse City, TX 75189

Hydraflo, Inc.
 1030 Milam St.
 Beaumont, TX 77701

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE	TOTAL			
36.	1 ea. O-Ring drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-37	UNIT			BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
		PRICE		199.59			
37.	5 ea. O-Ring, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-37	UNIT					
		PRICE		199.59			
		TOTAL		997.95			
38.	5 ea. O-Ring housing, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-2-2	UNIT					
		PRICE		9.67			
		TOTAL		48.35			
39.	2 ea. O-Ring inside seat, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-36-3	UNIT					
		PRICE		3.11			
		TOTAL		6.22			
40.	15 ea. O-Ring nozzle, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #84-20-4	UNIT					
		PRICE		2.82			
		TOTAL		42.30			
41.	5 ea. O-Ring seat, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B	UNIT					
		PRICE		3.11			
		TOTAL		15.55			
42.	5 ea. O-Ring seat, material Buna N, used for 6", Model B-84-B	UNIT					
		PRICE		3.11			
		TOTAL		15.55			
43.	5 ea. Screw, pipe, material steel, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-5-3	UNIT					
		PRICE		1.56			
		TOTAL		7.80			
44.	10 ea. Seal, hydrant seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #84-35-02	UNIT					
		PRICE		151.27			
		TOTAL		1,512.70			
45.	15 ea. Seat, hydrant, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #62-35-OR	UNIT					
		PRICE		168.24			
		TOTAL		2,523.60			
46.	5 ea. Seat, hydrant, material bronze B763 Alloy844, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #60-84-35-02	UNIT					
		PRICE		170.67			
		TOTAL		853.35			
47.	2 ea. Valve, bottom, material cast iron, used for 6", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-42	UNIT					
		PRICE		66.29			
		TOTAL		132.58			
48.	10 ea. Valve, hydrant, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-41	UNIT					
		PRICE		44.38			
		TOTAL		443.80			
49.	5 ea. Valve, hydrant, material rubber, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #60-84-41	UNIT					
		PRICE		65.59			
		TOTAL		327.95			
50.	2 ea. Valve, main, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #B56637	UNIT					
		PRICE		44.38			
		TOTAL		88.76			
51.	5 ea. Washer, thrust, material nylatron, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-4-4	UNIT					
		PRICE		5.64			
		TOTAL		28.20			
	TOTAL GROUP I	TOTAL		36,371.50			
	GROUP 2 - Clow Fire Hydrant Parts	UNIT					
1.	10 ea. Bearing, operating nut thrust, used for 5 1/4", brand medallion, Part #M-2	PRICE		1.11			
		TOTAL		11.10			

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 26, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE	TOTAL
2.	2 ea. Bolt & Nut set, safety flange, material zinc plated steel, used for 5 1/4", brand medallion, Part #M-46	UNIT	19.53	39.06
3.	2 ea. Cap, weather, material cast iron, used for 5 1/4", brand medallion, Part#M-26	UNIT	22.39	44.78
4.	10 ea. Coupling, safety stem, material steel tubing used for 5 1/4", brand Medallion, Part #M-10/M-220-2349	UNIT	27.70	277.00
5.	5 ea. Facing, drain valve, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-16/T1600804	UNIT	3.89	19.45
6.	5 set Flange, safety, material ductile iron, used for 5 1/4", Brand Medallion, Part #M-46/I-160-0808	UNIT	32.14	160.70
7.	50 ea. Kit, breakaway, size 5 1/4", used for breakflange repair, Model F2500, Part #R1620545	UNIT	110.34	5,517.00
8.	50 ea. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R1620665	UNIT	239.73	11,986.50
9.	45 ea. Kit, extension, size 6", used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R1620664	UNIT	202.85	9,128.25
10.	75 ea. Kit, safety flange, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R1620653	UNIT	99.66	7,474.50
11.	2 ea. Nut, operating, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-3	UNIT	76.48	152.96
12.	2 ea. Nut, thrust o-ring, material NBR, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-28	UNIT	0.55	1.10
13.	2 ea. Nut, thrust setscrew, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-58	UNIT	1.22	2.44
14.	100 ea. Overhaul kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model Medallion, 02KIT, 1 051	UNIT	61.93	6,193.00
15.	5 ea. Pin, drain valve facing, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-15	UNIT	0.44	2.20
16.	5 ea. Pin, safety coupling, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part, #M-11/T0400891	UNIT	2.44	12.20
17.	5 ea. Pin, safety coupling cotter, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-9	UNIT	0.57	2.85
18.	5 ea. Pin, upper stem, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-8	UNIT	4.77	23.85
19.	2 ea. O-Ring, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-54	UNIT	231.52	463.04

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Morrison Supply Co.
 5340 N Loop 1604 E
 San Antonio, TX 78247

Municipal Water Works Supply
 6959 State Hwy 276
 Royse City, TX 75189

Hydraflo, Inc.
 1030 Milam St.
 Beaumont, TX 77701

BID NOT TABULATED
 INCOMPLETE BID

BID NOT TABULATED
 INCOMPLETE BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts
 TIME & DATE: (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)
 3:00 p.m., July 26, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Morrison Supply Co.
 5340 N Loop 1604 E
 San Antonio, TX 78247

Municipal Water Works Supply
 6959 State Hwy 276
 Royse City, TX 75189

Hydraflo, Inc.
 1030 Milam St.
 Beaumont, TX 77701

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE	TOTAL			
20.	5 ea. O-Ring, drain, material N B R, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-53	UNIT	1.77	8.85	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
21.	5 ea. O-Ring, operating nut, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-1/T-240-0815	UNIT	2.81	14.05			
22.	5 ea. O-Ring, seat lower, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-20/T-240-1318	UNIT	3.76	18.80			
23.	5 ea. O-Ring, safety flange, material N B R, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-47	UNIT	1.89	9.45			
24.	50 ea. O-Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-19/F-1600805	UNIT	221.13	11,056.50			
25.	30 ea. O-Ring, seat upper, material NBR, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-18/T-240-0722	UNIT	5.44	163.20			
26.	5 ea. O-Ring, stem, material NBR used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-31	UNIT	0.44	2.20			
27.	5 ea. Screw, cap hold down, material zinc plated steel used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-25/T-040-0890	UNIT	0.44	2.20			
28.	5 ea. Stem, upper, used for 5 1/4", Brand Medallion, Part #M-7	UNIT	87.91	439.55			
29.	5 ea. Valve, lower plate, material brass, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-24/M1600801	UNIT	92.34	461.70			
30.	30 ea. Valve, main, material rubber used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-21/T-160-0802	UNIT	37.48	1,124.40			
31.	25 ea. Valve, upper plate, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-17/F-160-0803	UNIT	122.29	3,057.25			
32.	2 ea. Washer, lower valve plate lock, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-22	UNIT	1.45	2.90			
	TOTAL GROUP 2	TOTAL		57,873.03			
	GROUP 3 - U.S. PIPE FIRE HYDRANT PARTS						
1.	2 ea. Facing, drain valve, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Year 1994 and on, Metropolitan 250 M-94, Part #39	UNIT	8.80	17.60			
2.	5 ea. Gasket, standpipe ring, used for 5 1/4", Model H-205, Part #HR65	UNIT	5.60	28.00			
3.	5 ea. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model 250, Part #M94	UNIT	225.00	1,125.00			

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 26, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

4.	20 ea. Kit, traffic repair, used for 5 1/4" fire hydrant, Brand Metropolitan, Model 250 M-94 (Yr. 94 & after), Part #658665	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	99.00 1,980.00
5.	5 ea. Nut, operating, material cast iron, used for 5 1/4", Model sentinel, Part #1	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	36.00 180.00
6.	25 ea. Overhaul, kit, size 5 1/4", Model Metropolitan 250, Part #07KIT 1 525 052	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	112.50 2,812.50
7.	2 ea. Pin, top plate, material steel (shear proof), used for 5 1/4", Brand Year 1994 and on, Model Metropolitan 250 M-94, Part #34	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.20 10.40
8.	2 ea. Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Brand Year 1994 and on, Model Metropolitan 250 M-94, Part #42	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	187.42 374.84
9.	5 ea. O-Ring, seat, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Brand Year 1994 and on Model Metropolitan 250 M-94, Part #43	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1.72 8.60
10.	2 ea. Screw, hold down nut, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Sentinel, Part #7	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1.20 2.40
11.	5 ea. Valve, main, material rubber, used for 5 1/4" Yar 1994 and on, Model Metropolitan 250 M-94, Part #44	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	47.70 238.50
12.	5 ea. Valve, main, material rubber Buna-S, used for 5 1/4", Model H-205 USP hydrant, Part #H-44	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	46.59 232.95
13.	5 ea. Valve, upper plate, material bronze, used for 5 1/4" Year 1994 and on, Model Metropolitan 250 M-94, Part #35	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	172.09 860.45
	TOTAL GROUP 3	TOTAL	7,871.24
	GROUP 4 - Kennedy Fire Hydrant Parts		
1.	5 ea. Coupling, stem break, material cast iron, used for 5 1/4", Brand K84A, Part #K8116	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	29.56 147.80
2.	5 ea. Coupling, stem break, used for 5 1/4", Brand K11, Part #K1121	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	8.03 40.15
3.	2 ea. Facing, drain valve, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8137	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10.88 21.76
4.	5 ea. Gasket, seat ring, material copper asbestos, used for 5 1/4", Model K11, Part #K1133	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	13.69 68.45
5.	5 ea. Gasket, standpipe, used for 5 1/4", Model K11, Part #K1124	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	11.68 58.40
6.	75 ea. Kit, collision, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K-8149/1585C00R1X81Z	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	97.63 7,322.25
7.	15 ea. Kit, extension, size 12", Model K81A	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	207.66 3,114.90

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Morrison Supply Co.
 5340 N Loop 1604 E
 San Antonio, TX 78247

Municipal Water Works Supply
 6959 State Hwy 276
 Royse City, TX 75189

Hydraflo, Inc.
 1030 Milam St.
 Beaumont, TX 77701

BID NOT TABULATED
 INCOMPLETE BID

BID NOT TABULATED
 INCOMPLETE BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 26, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE	TOTAL			
8.	1 ea. Kit, extension, size 6", Model K81A	UNIT					
		PRICE		181.89			
9.	5 ea. Nozzle, remover tool, size 2 1/2" wrench hose, used for 5 1/4", Brand K81A, Part #K-8148/3310372	UNIT					
		PRICE	66.86				
		TOTAL		334.30			
10.	1 ea. Nut, operating stem, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8102	UNIT					
		PRICE		109.03			
11.	60 ea. Overhaul kit, size 5 1/4", Model guardian K81A, Part #05KIT 1 050	UNIT					
		PRICE	99.00				
		TOTAL		2,970.00			
12.	5 ea. Pin, cotter, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Mode K81A, Part #K-8117/443010	UNIT					
		PRICE	0.61				
		TOTAL		3.05			
13.	5 ea. Pin, drain valve, material steel, used for 5 1/4", Model K81, Part #K8133	UNIT					
		PRICE	7.66				
		TOTAL		38.30			
14.	5 ea. O-Ring, lower, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model Guardian, Part #K8130	UNIT					
		PRICE	1.80				
		TOTAL		9.00			
15.	5 ea. O-Ring, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8111	UNIT					
		PRICE	6.54				
		TOTAL		32.70			
16.	5 ea. O-Ring, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8126A	UNIT					
		PRICE	3.27				
		TOTAL		16.35			
17.	5 ea. Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K11, Part #K1132	UNIT					
		PRICE	134.05				
		TOTAL		670.25			
18.	10 ea. Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8128	UNIT					
		PRICE	150.05				
		TOTAL		1,500.50			
19.	5 set Ring, standpipe breaking (2 Per), material cast iron, used for 5 1/4", Model Guardian K81A, Part #K8119	UNIT					
		PRICE	42.31				
		TOTAL		211.55			
20.	5 ea. O-Ring, weather seal, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K11, Part #K1104	UNIT					
		PRICE	2.82				
		TOTAL		14.10			
21.	10 ea. Valve, main, material neoprene, used for 5 1/4", Model K81, Part #K8131	UNIT					
		PRICE	58.64				
		TOTAL		586.40			
22.	10 ea. Valve, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8136	UNIT					
		PRICE	128.37				
		TOTAL		1,283.70			
23.	15 ea. Valve, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8136/3316142	UNIT					
		PRICE	128.37				
		TOTAL		1,925.55			
	TOTAL GROUP 4	TOTAL		20,660.38			

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Morrison Supply Co.
 5340 N Loop 1604 E
 San Antonio, TX 78247

Municipal Water Works Supply
 6959 State Hwy 276
 Royse City, TX 75189

Hydraflo, Inc.
 1030 Milam St.
 Beaumont, TX 77701

BID NOT TABULATED
 INCOMPLETE BID

BID NOT TABULATED
 INCOMPLETE BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for
 FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 26, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

	GROUP 5 - Waterous Fire Hydrant Parts	UNIT				
	10 ea.	PRICE	99.00			
1.	Kit, traffic repair, used for 5 1/4", Model Pacer, Part #K528/AFTER June 1980	TOTAL	990.00	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
	1 ea.	UNIT PRICE				
2.	Pipe, lower standpipe, Brand Pacer	TOTAL	365.60			
	TOTAL GROUP 5	TOTAL	1,355.60			
	Terms		Net 30 days			
	Delivery Days		7-10 days			

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Morrison Supply Co.
 5340 N Loop 1604 E
 San Antonio, TX 78247

Municipal Water Works Supply
 6959 State Hwy 276
 Royse City, TX 75189

Hydraflo, Inc.
 1030 Milam St.
 Beaumont, TX 77701

***DENOTES LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Act Pipe & Supply
 Big Country Waterworks Supply, Inc.
 Ferguson
 HD Supply
 Hydraflo, Inc.
 Moore Supply
 Morrison Supply Co.
 Municipal Water Works Supply
 Quality Hydrant Co.

Demandstar
 SAWS Website